Wwww.ezganoon.com
| EXTRAORDINARY | | REGISTERED NO.S-2771 |

THE BALOCHISTAN GAZETTE
__ PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

eeanr
NO. 26/B QUETTA THURSDAY APRIL 30, 1992.

BALOCHISTAN PROVINCIAL ASSEMBLY SECRETARIAT.
ER AL ADO EM BLY SECRETARIAT.

NOTIFICATION.

Dated Quetta, the 30th April, 1992.

No.PAB/LEGIS : If[(1)/91. The Balochistan Assembly Members (Salaries

and Allowances) (Amendment) Bill, 1991 having been passed by the Provincial
Assembly of Balochistan on 10th March, 1992, and assented to by the Governor

of Balochistan, is hereby published as an Act of the Provincial Assembly.

THE BALOCHISTAN ASSEMBLY MEMBERS (SALARIES,
AND ALLOWANCES) (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1992.

(BALOCHISTAN ACT NO.I OF 1992).

(First published after having received the assent of the Governor of
‘Balochistan in the Balochistan Gazette (Extra ordinary) dated 30th April,
1992.)

AN

ACT

further to amend the Balochistan Assembly Members

(Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1975 (Il of 1975).

Preamble. WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Balochistan
Assembly Members (Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1975, in

the manner hereinafter appearing;

Short title ft is hereby enacted as follows :-

and

commencement. .
(1) This Act may be called the Balochistan Assembly

Printed by the Manager, Government Printing & Stationery Department Quetta.
G.P.(Q)636/B-60 Copies~5/92. Price Rs. 7/80



Members (Salaries and Allowances) (Amendment) Act, 1992.

(2) {t shall come into force at once and shall be deemed
to have taken effect on. the. 17th day of November, 1990. .

_mendment of 2. In the Balochistan Assembly Members (Salaries and
ection 3 of

‘et {fof 1975, Allowances) Act, 1975, hereinafter referred to as the said ~
Act, in Section 3, for the words "two thousand rupees”
the words "four thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

mendment of Bi. In the said Act, in section 4 for the words "two hundred

ion 4
€0. oo rupees" the words "four hundred rupees" shall be substituted,

mendment of 4. In the said Act, in clause (c) of section 5, for the

ti ;
ne eae words "rupees one and twenty paisas" the words “rupees

three and fifty paisas" shall be substituted.

isertion of 5 in the said Act, after section 5-A, the following new
aw Section5-B . F

: Act |l of section shall be inserted, namely :-
75.
"5-B. Free Travel Allowance. (1) Every Member shall

be provided during a year with vouchers of the value of
thirty thousand rupees for the purpose of any journey within™

Pakistan without payment of any fare by Air or by Rail:,

. Provided that where a person becomes a member during
the course of a year, the value of the vouchers with which
he is provided during that year shall not exceed the value
which bears the same proportion to thirty thousand rupees

as the un-expired portion of the year bears to a year.

iZ) A member who does not wish to be provided with

such vouchers shall be paid travelling allowance of twenty

five chousand rupees in cash during a year for the purpose: ~
of anv journey.

mendment of 6. {n the said Act, in clause (b) of section 6, for the
=e 0o words "five hundred rupees" the words "three thousand

rupees"” shall be substituted.

Wwww.ezganoon.com






Www.ezganoon.com
Insertion of

new Section 6-A

in Act Il of

1975.

Amendment of

Section 7 of

Act If of 1975.

Insertion of

new section 7-B

in Act IL of

1975.

ie In the said Act, after section 6, the following new
section shall be inserted, namely :-

"O-A, Office Maintenance _ allowance. A member = shalt

be entitled. to receive an office maintenance allowance at

the rate of two thousand rupees per month.
8. {n the said Act, in section 7 :-

(a) In clause (a) for the words "rupees fifteen hundred
per month" the words "rupees five thousand per

month" shall be substituted.

{b) In clause (c) for the word "typist" the words

"Senior Scale Stenographer” shall be substituted.

9. In the said Act after section 7, the following new section
shall be inserted, namely :-

"7-B. Session allowance. A member shail be entitled
to a session allowance of rupees five hundred per day for

actual working days.
MUHAMMAD HASAN SHAH

Secretary, ;
Provincial Assembly of Balochistan.



