www.ezganoon.com
EXTRAORDINARY REGISTERED NO. S-2771

‘THE BALOCHISTAN GAZETTE
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

NO. 12 QUETTA WEDNESDAY FEBRUARY — 26, 2003.
BALOCHISTAN PROVINCIAL ASSEMBLY SECRETARIAT.

NOTIFICATION.
Dated Quetta. the 26th February. 2003.

No. PAB/Legis: V (3)/2003. The Balochistan Assembly Members (Salaries and
Allowances) (Amendment) Bill. 2003 having been passed by the Provincial Assembly of
Balochistan on 25th February, 2003 and assented to by the Governor of Balochistan. is
hereby published as an Act of the Provincial Assembly:

THE BALOCHISTAN MEMBERS (SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES
AMENDMENT) ACT, 2003.
(BALOCHISTAN ACT NO. TIE OF 2003).

(First published after having received the assent of the Governor of Balochistan in the
Balochistan Gazette (Extra Ordinary) dated the 26th February. 2003).

AN

ACT

further to amend the Balochistan Assembly Members (Salaries and
Allowances) Act. 1975 (ID of 1975).

Printed by the Controtter, Goverament Printing & Stationery Department, Balochistan. Quetta.
D.No. -100-Copies-3-2003,



Preamble WHEREAS ir is “x i jent further to amend the Balochistan
Assembly Members (Salaries a

hereinafter appearing: 4
gla

$e
?

It is hereby enacted as folk
¥

Short title and t. (1) This Act may, bo called the Balochistan Assembly
commencement Members (Salaries arid Allowantées) (Amendment) Act, 2003.

(2) It shall come inte-force'at once. *

Amendment of a In the Balochistan Assembly: Menybers. (Salaries and Allowances)
Section 3 of Act 1975. hereinatter referred to ag the 'sdia Act. in section 3, for the words ~
Act | of 1975, “four thousand rupees” the words “ten thousand rupees” shall be

substituted. :

Amendment of X, In the said Act. In section 4. for the words “four hundred rupees”
Section 4 of the words “five hundred and fifty rupees” shall be substituted...
Amendment of 4. In the said Act. in sub sédtion (2) of section 5-B for the words
Section 5 (B) of “twenty-five thousand rupees” the words “fifty thousand rupees” shall
Act Il of 1975, be substituted, ue

Amendment of a, In the said Act In Section 6 for; the words “three ¢housand
Section 6 of ” rupees” the words “five thousand rupees” shall be substituted. 4.4 ey /
Amendment of 6. In the sitid Act. in Section '6-A’ for the words “two thousand
Section 6-A of rupees™ the words “five thousand rupees” shall be subs ited, “p>
Insertions ow 7, In the said. Actalled devtion! 6A! tho (M14Wing new sections shall
Section 6-B in be inserted namely: i .

a “6-B. Sumptuary. Allowance. for: er.” A:Member shalt: be?!

entitled to receive Sumptuary Allowance at the rate of “three

thousand rupees” per month,
Amendment in 8. In the said Act. in clause (a) of section-7 for the word “rupees five

Section 7(a) of thousand” the word “rupees bventy thousand” shall be substituted.
Act Hof 1973,

www.ezganoon.com



Wwww.ezganoon.com

Amendment in
Section 7(d) of
Act EL of 1975,

Insertion of New

Section 7-E in
Act-1l of 1975,

Insertion of New

Section 10 in
Act-1l of 1975,

ad

9, In the said Act. In clause (a) of seetion-7 for the word “five
hundred rupees” the word “seven thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

9, In the said Act. afer section 7-D. the follow ing new section shall be
inserted. namely:-

“7-E. Sumptuary Allowance for leader of O osition, The
Feader of Opposition shall be entitled to receive Sumptuary
Allowance at the rate of rupees five thousand per month.

Official Transport for Chairman of Committee,

A Member who holds the office of a Chairman of a Committee of

Assembly. other than that of a Select Committce or a Special Committee
shall be entitled to the use of net more than one olficial car regardless of his
entitlement to have an official car in any other capacity, and where he avails
himself of this facility. he shall not be entitled to receive the conveyance
allowance:

Provided that-

(i) only one car shall be provided to a chairman of a (***) Committee
during the whole term of his office:
gi) A Chairman of a (***) Committee shall be allowed “five thousand

rupees” per month as POL. charges.
MUHAMMAD KHAN MENGAL

Secretary,
Provincial Assembly of Balochistan,



