Wwww.ezganoon.com

THE GBLA MEMBERS

(Salaries, Allowances and Privileges) (Amendment) Act, 2010.
GBLA ACT NO.V OF 2015

An Act to amend the. Gileit Baltistan ”

Legislative Assembly Members (Salaries,
Allowances and Privileges) Act, 2010.

www.ezganoon.com



vert) THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA, DECAL; 2015 airy. 9433

Whereas it is. expedient; to amend the Gilgite.. a: »,

Baltistan’ : Legislative, Assembly,., : Members, :; : ; bribe gly aa
(Salaries, Allowances and Privileges) . Act, iene oe

2011, in the manner hereinafter appearing,

Ttis hereby enacted as follows:-— 2 MU Ete ee

This Act may be called the Gilgit Baltistan Short tle and
Legislative Assembly Members (Salaries, ., _,, commencement
SEE OAR Ol Ba SAT

= Allowances and Privileges) (Amendment) Act,
It shall come into force at'once.

Tn the Gilgit Baitistan Legislative ‘Assembly’ Aienditént of settion-
‘Members (Salaries, “Allowances and’ Priviléges) " “3 of the GB Legislative

Act, 2010, hereinafter referred to as the said Assembly Act Ne. Iv
Act, in section »3;° for® “the lwords' fe 1a

: seeps | ‘6f2010.,
thousand”, the words “séventy ‘thousand Shall" © 4 e
be substituted.

“Tn the ‘said “Act,"in section’ 5! for ithe words’ “A tiendment of Section
“twelve thousand”, the: swords “forty ithousand™s 85 of curs ‘ActiNo. IV
shall be substituted. : ee a DT 0 10f:2010i0%

In:the:said*Act;.in section:6, forithe words “five!lci\Amendmentof'section: !

thousand”;the words “fifteen thousand: shall 6 of GBLA® Act Not IV
be substituted.

In the said Act, in place: nb subssectioni 130) “Boniccarentst sub-

and 13(2) the followings new; sub-section 13(1).» section 13(1):and 13(2)
shall be added: Catdecilaesy

“A Parliamentary Secretary and his family. shall

be entitled to Medical facilities at Government -

expense for the following diseases:

1. Cancer 0: HS etal

2. HepatitisC |. Pigg

3. Heart

In the- said Act, after section 13(1), the Addition of sub-section’
following sub-section (2) shall be added: 13(2) of GBLA Act No. |
“13(2) A member shall be entitled to receive’ _ Iv

medical allowance at the rate. of “fifteen

é thousand rupees” per month, |

Wwww.ezganoon.com






www.ezganoon.com
944

10.

tt

12,

(Haji Fida Muhammad Nashad)

THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., DEC. 31, 2015 [PARTI
In the said Act, in section 14, in sub-section 2,

for the words “five thousand”, the words “ten

thousand” shall be substituted.

In the said Act, in section 16, for the words “ten

thousand”, the words “thirty five thousand”
shall be substituted.

In the said Act, the following new sub-section
shall be added:-—

“16() A member shall be entitled to receive
Gas hill of “ten thousand rupees” per month”.

In the said Act, after section 14(2), the
following new sub-section shall be added:— |

“14(3). A member shall _be entitled to receive
mobile expense worth “five thousand rupees”
per month”.

In the said Act, in sub-section -18(ii), the words
“thirty thousand” shall be substituted for. the.

words “eight thousand”:

In the said. Act, the folie inet new section shall
be added: PONY

“(21) Any provision regarding increase in the
salary of Member in proportion to'the increase
in the salary of civil servants shall no longer be
applicable”.

Speaker

Gileit-Baltistan Legislative Assembly

&

Amendment of section



14 of GBLA Act. No.
Y

Amendment of section
16 of GBLA Act No.

\V4

Addition of sub-section
16(i) of GBLA Act No.

v

Addition of sub-section
14(3) in GBLA Act No.
Vv,

Amendment of sub-
section 18(ii)»

Addition of new
section 21

(Mir Ghazanfar Ali Khan)

Governor
Gilgit-Baltistan

PRINTED BY THE MANAGER, PRINTING CORPORATION OF. PAKISTAN PRESS, ISLAMABAD
PUBLISHED BY THE DEPUTY CONTROLLER, STATIONERY AND FORMS, UNIVERSITY ROAD, KARACHL.

www. Benoee: com



