Volume X (1994-2000)

AZAD GOVERNMENT OF THE STATE OF JAMMU AND KASHMIR
LAW, JUSTICE AND PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS DEPARTMENT
MUZAFFARABAD

Dated 18-01-2000.

No. 35-43/LD/Leg/2000. The following Act of the Assembly received

the assent of the President on 12" January, 2000 is hereby published for

general information.
(ACT IT OF 2000)

AN

ACT

to amend the Azad Jammu and Kashmir Courts and Laws Code, 1949
WHEREAS it is expedient to amend the Azad Jammu and Kashmir
Courts and Laws Code, 1949 for the purposes hereinafter appearing;
It is hereby enacted as follows:-

1. Short title and commencement:- (1) This Act may be called the
Azad Jammu and Kashmir Courts and Laws Code (Amendment)
Act, 1999,

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of Section 31, of the Azad Jammu and Kashmir
Courts_and_ Laws Code, 1949:- In the Azad Jammu and
Kashmir Courts and Laws Code, 1949, hereinafter referred to as
the said Code, in Section 31, in subsection (2) for the word and
figure “Rs. 25000” the word and figure “Rs. 100000” shall be
substituted.

3. Amendment of Section 36, of the Azad Jammu and Kashmir
Courts and Laws Code, 1949:- In the said Code, in clause (a)
of subsection (2) to section 36, for the word and figure “Rs.
5000” the word and figure “Rs. 100000” shall be substituted.

4. Repeal:- The Azad Jammu and Kashmir Courts and Laws Code
(Amendment) Ordinance, 1999 (Ordinance XV of 1999) is
hereby repealed.

Sd/- IRSHAD AHMED QURESHI)
Deputy Secretary Law

95



