
Volume XII (2011-2014)

AZAD GOVERNMENT OF THE STATE OF JAMMU AND KASHMIR
LAW JUSTICE PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS AND HUMAN RIGHTS
DEPARTMENT MUZAFFARABAD

Dated: 24th March, 2014

No. LD/Legis/143-54/2014. The following Act of Assembly received the
assent of the President on 20th day of March, 2014, is hereby published
for general information.

(ACT IV OF 2014)

An

Act

further to amend the Azad Jammu and Kashmir Legislative Assembly
Speaker (Salary, Allowances and Privileges) Act, 1975

WHEREAS, it is expedient further to amend the Azad Jammu
and Kashmir Legislative Assembly Speaker (Salary, Allowances and
Privileges) Act, 1975 (Act XVII of 1975) in the manner hereinafter
appearing;

It is hereby enacted as follows:-

1. Short title and Commencement.-(1) This Act may be called the
Azad Jammu and Kashmir Legislative Assembly Speaker
(Salary, Allowances and Privileges) (Amendment) Act, 2014.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of Section 3, Act XVII of 1975.-In the Azad
Jammu and Kashmir Legislative Assembly Speaker (Salary,
Allowances and Privileges) Act, 1975 (Act XVII of 1975),
hereinafter referred to as the said Act, in Section 3, in sub-section
(1) for the words “thirty seven thousand”, the words “forty eight
thousand” shall be substituted.

3. Amendment of Section 7, Act XVII of 1975.-In the said Act, in
Section 7,the words “cars” shall be substituted by the word
“vehicles”.

4. Amendment of Section 8, Act XVII of 1975.-In the said Act, in

Section 8, the word “twenty five thousand” wherever occurring
shall be substituted by the words “fifty five thousand”.

5. Amendment of Section 11, Act XVII of 1975.-In the said Act,
in Section 11,-

(a) for the words “one thousand” the words “three thousand”
shall be substituted; and





Volume XII (2011-2014)

(b) in the second proviso, after clause (iti) following new
clause (iv) shall be inserted:-

“(iv) — while on tour, if accommodation is not available
in the rest house and the Speaker stays in the
hotel, he shall be paid the actual room rent on
production of proper receipt.”

Sd/-
(Ch. Muhammad Nawaz)
Section Officer Law

57


