
AZAD GOVERNMENT OF THE STATE OF JAMMU AND KASHMIR
LAW, JUSTICE AND PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS DEPARTMENT
MUZAFFARABAD

Dated the 25" June, 1995.

No. 500-07/LD/Leg/95. The following Act of the Assembly received the

assent of the President on 23rd June, 1995 is hereby published for

general information:-
(ACT VII OF 1995)

AN

ACT

to amend the Azad Jammu and Kashmir Legislative Assembly Speaker

(Salary, Allowances and Privileges) Act, 1975

WHEREAS it is expedient to amend the Azad Jammu and Kashmir

Speaker (Salary, Allowances and Privileges) Act, 1975 (Act XVII of

1975), for the purposes hereinafter appearing;

It is hereby enacted as follows:-

1. Short title and commencement:- (1) This Act may be called the
Azad Jammu and Kashmir Legislative Assembly Speaker
(Salary, Allowances and Privileges) (Amendment) Act, 1995.

(2) It shall come into force at once and shall be deemed to
have taken effect from 12" February, 1995.

2. Amendment of Section 3, Act XVII of 1975:- In the Azad
Jammu and Kashmir Legislative Assembly Speaker (Salary,
Allowances and Privileges) Act, 1975 (Act XVII of 1975),
hereinafter referred to as the said Act, in Section 3, for the words
“seven thousand”, the words “twenty thousand two hundred and
fifty” shall be substituted.

3. Amendment of Section 4, Act XVII of 1975:- In the said Act,
in Section 4, for the words “three thousand”, the words “five
thousand” shall be substituted.

4. Amendment of Section 6, Act XVII of 1975:- In the said Act,
in Section 6, for the words “five thousand”, the words “six
thousand” shall be substituted.

5. Amendment of Section 8, Act XVII of 1975:- In the said Act,
in Section 8, for the words “fifteen thousand”, wherever
occurring the words “seventeen thousand” shall be substituted.



6. Amendment of Section 9, Act XVII of 1975:- In the said Act,
in Section 9,-

(a) in sub-section (2), in clause (a), for the words “actual”
the words “Business Class” shall be substituted.
(b) in sub-section (4), in Clause (a) for sub-clause (i) the
following shall be substituted:-
“@) an ordinary first-cum-second class carriage or a
‘B’ class tourist car or an ‘A’ class tourist car, if
a ‘B’ class tourist car is not available; or” and



(c) in sub-section (7), in clause (a), for the words “seventy
five paisa’s per mile” the words “three rupees per
kilometer” shall be substituted.

Amendment of Section 13, Act XVII of 1975:- In the said Act,

in Section 13, between the words “to” and “such” the words

“First Class air fare and” shall be inserted.

Amendment of Section 15, Act XVII of 1975:- In the said Act,

in Section 15, in sub-section (1) for the words “Prime Minister”

the word “President” shall be substituted and thereafter in sub-
section (2), for the words “five thousand” the words “twenty
thousand, two hundred and fifty” shall be substituted.

Amendment of Section 21, Act XVII of 1975:- In the said Act,

in Section 21, for the word “two” the word “five” shall be

substituted.

Sd/- (SYED SHAKIR SHAH)
DEPUTY SECRETARY (LAW)


