Volume VIII (1985-88)

AZAD GOVERNMENT OF THE STATE OF JAMMU AND KASHMIR
LAW AND PARLTAMENTARY AFFAIRS DEPARTMENT

MUZAFFARABAD
Dated the 9" June, 1988.

No. 302-306/88. The following Act passed by the Assembly on 30" day
of May, 1988, received the assent of the President on 4" day of June
1988, is hereby published for general information:-

AN
ACT

(ACT VI OF 1988)
to amend the Dowry and Bridal Gifts (Restriction) Act, 1976.
WHEREAS it is expedient to amend the dowry and Bridal Gifts

(Restriction) Act, 1976 (Act, IX of 1976) in the manner hereinafter
appearing;

Short title and Commencement. - (1) This Act may be called
the Dowry and Bridal Gifts (Restriction) (Amendment) Act,
1988.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

Amendment of Section 3, Act, IX of 1976.- In the dowry and
bridal Gifts (Restriction) Act, 1976 (Act IX of 1976), hereinafter
referred to as the said, Act, in Section 3, for the words ‘two
thousand and five hundred’ the words ‘ten thousand’ shall be
substituted.

Amendment of Section 4, Act, IX of 1976.- In the said Act, in
Section 4, the words ‘one hundred, the words ‘five hundred’
shall be substituted.

Amendment of Section 6, Act, IX of 1976.- In the said Act, in
Section 6, for the words ‘two thousand and five hundred’ the
words ‘five thousand’ shall be substituted.

Sd/-

(Syed Atta Mohy-ud-Din Qadri
Deputy Secretary Law

438



