
oo ~ 2 7 $ - 1033
. ; REGISTERED No j—724-

te (32) of Pakistan

EXTRAORDINARY
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY
"ISLAMABAD, SATURDAY, JULY 27, 1985
See En
PART I
Acts, Ordinances, President’s Orders and Regulations including Martial Law
Orders and Regulations

SENATE SECRETARIAT
Islamabad, the 15th July, 1985

The following Acts of Maijlis-e-Shoora (Parliament) received the assent of
the President on the 15th July, 1985. and are hereby published for general
information :—

ACT No. [X oF 1985
ee
An Act further to amend the Representation of the People Act, 1976

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Representation of the People
Act, 1976 (LXXXV of 1976), for the purpose hereinafter appearing ;

It is hereby enacted as follows :—

1, Short title and commencement.—(1) This Act may be called the
Representation of the People (Seventh Amendment) Act, 1985.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of section 64, Act LXXXV of 1976.—In the Representation
of the People Act, 1976 (LXXXV of 1976), in section 64, after the word
“sections”, the figure and comma “ 476,” shall be inserted.

3. Repeal—The Representation of the People (Seventh Amendment) Ordi-
nance, 1985 (XXIV of 1985), is hereby repealed.
(391)

Price: Ps. 60,
T3064 Ge Gael



SD

394 THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., -JULY 27, 1985 [PART 1

5. Substitution of section 9, Aci XXVII of 1974.—In the said Act, for
section 9 the following shall be substituted, namely :—

“9. Housing allowance-—-A_ member shal! be paid a housing allowance
at the rate of three hundred rupzes for each day during any period of

residence on duty.”

6. Amendment of section 10, Act XXVIE of 1974.—In . the said Act, in
section 10,—

(a) in sub-section (1), for the words “six thousand and six hundred
Tupees ”, twice occurring, the words “ fifteen thousand rupees ” shall be
substituted ; and

(b) in sub-section (2), for the words “four thousand and two hundred
rupees bears to the sum of six thousand and six hundred rupees ” the
words “ten thousand rupees bears to the sum of fifteen thousand
rupees ” shall be substituted.

7. Substitution of section 1i, Act XXVIE ef 1974.—In the said Act, for
section 11 the following shail be substituted, namely :—

“IL. Telephone—A member shall be entitled to have a telephone
installed at his residence at Government expenses where facilities for
installation are available and to a monthly allowance of five hundred
rupees on account of telephone charges, whether a telephone is so
installed or not.”.

8. Insertion of new section 11A, Act XXVIII of 1974.—In the said Act, after
section 11, amended as aforesaid, the following new section shall be inserted,
namely :—

“1A. Office maintenance allowance—A member shal! be entitled to

receive an office maintenance allowance at the rate of seven hundred
and fifty rupees per mensem.”.

9. Additional of new section 14A, Act XXVIE of 1974.—~In the said Act,
afer section 14, the following new section shall be added, namely :—

“14A. Act to have effect Subject to instructions, etc-—This Act shall
have effect subject to such instructions, rules, exceptions, further con-
cessions or easements as the Federal Government may from time to
time issue or grant. ”.

ACT No. XIII oF 1985
$3c$71--——->7rkvxwReeEe———

An Act further to amend the Modaraba Companies and Modarabas (Floatation
and Control) Ordinance, 1980



Wuereas it is expedient further to amend the Modaraba Companies and
Mcdaraba (Floatation and Control) Ordinance, 1980 (XXXI of 1980), for the

purpose hereinafter appearing ;



33

Part I] THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., JULY 27, 1985 395

It is hereby enacted as follows ; —

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) This Act may be called the Modaraba
Companies and Modaraba (Floatation and Control) (Second Amendment) Act,
1985,

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of section 5, Ordimance XXXI of 1980.—In the Modaraba
Companies and Modaraba (Floatation and Controi) Ordinance, 1980 (XXXI of
1980), im section 5, in clause (b), for the words “five million” the words “two
and a haif million” shall be substituted.

ACT No. XIV oF 1985
—_—____—CW®w
An Act further to amend the Employee's Cost of Living (Relief) Act, 1973

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Employees’ Cost of Living
(Relief) Act, 1973 (I of 1974), for the purpose hereinafter appearing ;

It is hereby enacted as follows :—

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) This Act may be called the
Employees’ Cost of Living (Relief) (Amendment) Act, 1985.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of section 3, Act I of 1974.—In the Employees’ Cost of
Living (Relief) Act, 1973 (I of 1974), in section 3,—

(a) in sub-section (5), in the Explanation, after the word “ sub-section ”,
the words, brackets and figure “and sub-section (6)” shall be

(b) after sub-section (5), amended as aforesaid, the following new sub-
section shall be added, namely :—

“(6) In addition to the cost of living allowance admissible under sub-
sections (1), (2), (3) and (4), or, as the case may be, sub-section
(5), if any, every employee whose wages do not exceed one
thousand five hundred rupees shall, in respect of his employment
on or after the first day of July, 1985, whether on time-work or
piece-work basis, be paid by his employer an increase in wages
at the rate of 13.5 per cent of his wages :

Provided that ue said increase in wages shali be set off—

(a) against the amount payable as a relief due to rise in the
cost of living under an agreement or settlement reached, or
an award given, under the Industrial Relations Ordinance,

1969 (XXIII of 1969), which has been announced and be-



come effective on or after the first day of January, 1984; and


