
REGISTERED No. ee

_ EXTRAORDINARY .*
PUBLISHED 6Y, AUTHORITY
LEO MNS SAN ame RET ——
ISLAMABAD, WEDNESDAY, BRUARY 7, 1973

PART I
Acts, Ordinances, President’s Orders and Regulations

NATIONAL ASSEMBLY OF PAKISTAN
fslamabad, the Tth February, 1973

The following Acts of the National Assembly received the assent of the
President on the 4th February, 1973, and are hereby published. for general
information :—

ACT No. XIV or 1973
An Act further to amend the Workmen's Compensation Act, 1923

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Workmen’s Compensation
Act. 1923 (ViI1 of 1923), for the purposes hereinafter appearing ;

It is hereby enacted as follows :—

1, Short title and commencement.—({i) This Act may be called the Work-
men’s Compensation (Amendment) Act. 1973.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of section 2, Act VIII of 1923.—In the Workmen’s Com-
pensation Act, 1923 (VII of 1923), hereinafter referred to as the said Act, in
section 2. in sub-section (1), in clause (nm), in sub-clause (ii), for the words “ five
hundred ” the words “one thousand” shall be substituted.

3. Amendment of section 4, Act VIIT of 1923.—In the said Act, in see-
tion 4, in sub-section (1),—
(a) in clause A, in sub-clause (ii), for the words “four hundred” the
words “four thousand” shall be substituted ;
(37)
Price : Ps. 37
(2918 Ex. Gaz.]



Fart 1] THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., FEB. 7, 1973 >

Roman Urdu Translation of Affirmation

* Main............-cc cece ee eee Khuda-i-Taala ko hazir-o-nazir jankar Khulus ke
sath igrar karta hun kih Pakistan ki Hukumat ka sidq-i-dil se wafadar aur
itaatguzar rahunga aur apna farz samjhunga kih Pakistan Coast Guards men
imandari aur wafadari ke sath khidmat baja laun. Bharti hone ki sharait ke
mutabiq khushki, hava ya samundar ke raste jahan bhi jane ka hukam milega
jaunga aur jise mera afsar muqarrar kia jaega uske tamam ahkam ki tamil aur
itaat karunga, khuwah us men mujhe jan ka khatra kiun na ho”,

ACT No. XIX or 1973
An Act further to amend the Law Reforms Ordinance, 1972 (XII of 1972)

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Law Reforms Ordinance, 1972
(XII of 1972), for the purposes hereinafter appearing ;

It is hereby enacted as follows :—-

1. Short title and commencement.—({1) This Act may be called the Law
Reforms (Amendment) Act, 1973.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of section 1, Ordinance XII of 1972.—-In the Law Reforms
Ordinance, 1972 (XII of 1972), in section 1, in sub-section (2),—

(a) the words, comma and figure “ not later than the first day of January,
1973” shall be omitted ; and

(b) after the word “behalf” at the end, the words “and different dates
may be so specified for different areas in a Province so that the
amendments in the Code are brought in force throughout the Province
progressively ” shall be added.

3. Repeal.—The Law Reforms (Second Amendment) Ordinance, 1972
(LXII of 1972), is hereby repealed.

ACT No. XX oF 1973
An Act further to amend the Companies Profits (Workers Participation) Act, 1968

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Companies Profits (Workers
Participation) Act, 1968 (XII of 1968), for the purposes hereinafter appearing ;

It is hereby enacted as follows :—

1. Short title and commencement.—{1) This Act may be called the Companies
Profits (Workers Participation) (Amendment) Act, 1973.

(2) It shall come into force at once.



30 THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., FEB. 7, 1973 [Part 1 —

2. Amendment of section 3, Act XH of 1968.—In the Companies Profits (Wor-
kers Participation) Act, 1968 (XII of 1968), hereinafter referred to as the said
Act, in section 3, in sub-section (1),— i.

(a) for clause (b) the following shail be substituted, namely :— ~

“ (b) pay every year to the Fund not later than nine months after the
close of that year five per cent of its profits during such year.” ; and

(b) Explanation (1) shail be omitted. .
3. Amendment of the scheme, Act XII of 1968.—In the said Act, in the scheme,—

(1) in paragraph I, in clause (i),—
(i) the words “‘ in any shift” shall be omitted ; and
(ii) for the figure ** 100” the figure “‘ 50” shall be substitutec ; :
(2) in paragraph 4, in clause (a), the words, brackets and figure “ sub-
clause (i) of ’’ shall be omitted ;
(3) in paragraph 5,—
(i) for clause (b) the following shall be substituted, namely :—

“ (b) A worker who volun‘arily leaves the employment of the com-
pany or whose services are terminated shall be entitled to re-
ceive 100 per cent of the net asset value of the units standing
in his name.” ; ~

(ii) clauses (c), (d) and (e) shall be omitted ;

(ii) for clause (f) ihe following shall be substituted, namely :—

“(f) Aworker who continues in the service of the company shall be
entitled to receive 100 per cent of the net asset value of the
units in his name cach year or he may choose to leave his
share in the Fund:

Provided that worker while in employment may choose to
encash all the units standing in his name at any time at his
discretion.” ; and

(iv) in clause (g), the words “‘irrespective of the period of employment”
shail be omitted ; and

(4) in paragraph 7, for the words, figure and comams “on the expiry of
3 years from the date he becomes entitled to the benefits of the
scheme, he may, at his option” the following shall be substituted,
namely :— an
“his services are terminated or in the event of his retirement or death
or on the expiry of three years from the date he voluntarily
chooses to contribute a part of his wages, cash bonus, dividend or
interest to the Fund, he, at his option, or, in the event of his
death, his nominated beneficiary, may ”.

_ 4. Repeal.—The Companies Profits (Workers Participation) (Amendment)
Ordinance, 1972 (XLVII of 1972), is hereby repealed.




