
_ $+ 1933
REGISTERED Ne. 7,

EXTRAGRDINARY
PUBLISHED SY AUTRORITY

eT eee a

___ ISLAMABAD, MONDAY, JULY i, 1985

ees Saeed Wy en lat ne te Senin yeaa

PART I

Acts, Ordinances. President’s Orders and Regulations including Martial Law
Orders and Reguiations

NATIONAL ASSEMBLY SECRETARIAT

Islamabad, the 30th June. 1985

The following Act of Parliament received the assent of the President on the
25th June, 1985, and is hereby published for general information :--

Acr No. I or 1985
SS

An Act to give effect to the financial proposals of the Federal Governimem for
the year beginning on the first day of July, 1985. and te amend ceriait: laws
WHEREAS it is expedient to make provisions to give effect to the financial
proposals of the Federal Government for the year beginning on ihe first day of
July, 1985, and to amend certain laws for the purposes hereinafter appearing
Tt is hereby enacted as follows :——
1, Short title and extent.—(1)} This Act may be called the Finance Act, 1985.
(2) Tt extends to the whole of Pakistan.
2. Amendment of Act XV of 1963.--The following amendments shall be
made in the Wealth Tax Act. 1963 (XV of 1963), namely :—
(1) in section 2,—
(a) in clause (e),—
fi) in sub-clause (i), after the semi colon at the end. the word
“and” shall be added ;
(31)
Price: Rs. 210
{2991 Ex, Gaz.]



oe a a |

380 THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., JULY 1, 1985 [Part T
{c) in sub-section (2), for lhe wos
words “sixty thousand rupees” shall be substituted ; o>

(d) in sub-section (3), for the words “one thousand two hundred and
fifty rupees” the words “eight thousand rupevs” shall be substituted +
and

(e) in sub-section (4), for the words “one thousand two hundred and
fifty rupees” the words “eight thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

6, Amendment of section 9, Act EXXXII of 1975—In the said Acl, in
section 9,—

(a) in sub-section (2), in clause (b), for the words “fifty rupees” the
words “one hundred and fifty rupees” and for the words “ twenty-
five rupees” the words “ seventy-five rupees” shall be substituted :

(b) in sub-section (3), in clause (b) for the words “ fifty rupees ” the words
“one hundred and fifty rupees” and for the words “twenty-five
rupecs” the words “seventy-five rupees" shall be substituted: and

(c) in sub-section (5), for the words “one rupee per mile” the words
“two rupees per kilometre” and for the words “ seventy-five paisa
per mile” the words “one rupee and fifty paisa per kilometre”, and
for the words “fifty rupees” the words “one hundred and __ fifty -
rupees” shall be substituted.

7. Amendment of section 17, Act LXXXII of 1975,—In the said Act, in

section 17, in sub-section (2), for the words “four thousand rupees” the words
“seven thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

ACT No. Ul or 1985 JO

An Act further to amend the Deputy Chairman and Deputy Speaker (Salaries,
Allowances and Priviteges) Act, 1975

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Deputy Chairman and
Deputy Speaker (Salaries, Allowances and Privileges) Act, 1975 (LXXXIII of
1975), for the purposes hereinafter appearing :

Tt is hereby enacted as follows :~—

1, Short title and commencement,—(1) This Act may be called the Deputy
Chairman and Deputy Speaker (Salaries, Allowances and Privileges) (Amend-
ment) Act, 1985.



2./

pase J] THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, ERIRAS JULY i 1985 385

Se a =

(2) Tt shall come into force at once and shall be deemed to have nie
effect on the first day of March, 1985.

2. Amendment of section 3, Act LXXXIH of 1975.—In the Deputy Chair-
min and Deputy Speaker (Salaries, Allowances and Privileges) Act, 1975
(LXXX1if of 1975), hereinafter referred to as the said Act, in section 3, for
the words “three thousand rupees” the words “six thousand rupees” shall be
substituted.

3. Amendment of section 4, Act LXXXUI of 1975.—In the aid Act, in
section 4, for the words “one thousand and five hundred rupees” the words
“four thousand rupees * shali be substituted,

4. Amendment of section 6, Act LXXXIIM of 1975.—In the said Act, in
section 6, for the words “ six hundred rupees” the words “two thousand rupees ™
shall be substituted.

5, Amendment of section 8 Act LXXXIM of 1975.—-In the said Act, in
section 8,—
(a) in sub-section (1), for the proviso the following shall be substituted,
namely :—

“Provided that half of the electricity and gas charges in excess of
seven hundred and fifty rupees per mensem shall be paid by the
Deputy Chairman, or ag the case may be, the Deputy Speaker.”

(b) after sub-section (1), amended as aforesaid, the following new sub-
section shall be inserted, namely :—

“(1A) The assessed rent of a house hired for the use of the Deputy
Chairman or the Deputy Speaker shall in no case exceed seven
thousand rupees per mensem.” ;

(c) in sub-section (2), for the . words “twenty thousand rupees” the
words “fifty thousand rupees” shall be substituted ;

{d) in sub-section (3), for the words “one thousand rupees” the words
“seven thousand rupees” shall be substituted ; and

(e) in sub-section (4) for the words “one thousand rupees” the words
' “seven thousand rupecs ” shall be substituted.



ad

832 THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., JULY 1, 1985 [Parr I

6. Amendment of section 9, Act LXXXIH of 1975.—In the said Act, ia
section 9,— ‘

(a) in sub-section (2), in clause (b), for the words “ fifty rupees * the words
“one hundred and fifty rupees”, and for the words “twenty-five
rupees” the words “seventy-five rupees”, shall be substituted ;

(b) in sub-section (3), in clause (b), for the words “fifty rupees” the
words “one hundred and fifty rupees”, and for the words “twenty-
five rupees” the words “seventy-five rupees”, shall be substituted;
and

(c) in sub-section (5), for the words “one rupee per mile” the words
“two rupees per kilometre”, for the words “seventy-five paisa per
tnile” the words “one rupee and fifty pasia per kilometre”, and
for the words “fifty rupees” the words “one hundred and fifty
rupees”, shall be substituted.

7. Amendment of section 17, Act LXXXUI of 1975.—In the said Act, in
section 17, in sub-section (2), for the words “three thousand rupees ” the words
six thousand rupées” shall be substituted. ,

M. A. HAQ,
Secretary.

Se Se
PRINTED BY THE MANAGER, PRINTING CORPORATION OF PAKISTAN PRPSS, 7SLAMABAG
PUBLISHED BY THE MANAGER OF PUBLICATIONS, KARACHI


