
S - 1033
REGISTERED No L646

Q
qa
ro
=
eo

de
1%)

cca? of Pakistan

EXTRAORDINARY
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

ISLAMABAD, SATURDAY, JULY 27, 1985

Rp iS oe en

Te

PART I

Acts, Ordinances, President’s Orders and Regulations including Martial Law
Orders and Regulations

SENATE SECRETARIAT
Islamabad, the 15th July, 1985
The following Acts of Majlis-e-Shoora (Parliament) received the assent of

the President on the 15th July, 1985, and are hereby published for general
information :—

ACT_No. [X oF 1985
An Act further to amend the Representation of the People Act, 1976

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Representation of the People
Act, 1976 (LXXXV of 1976), for the purpose hereinafter appearing ;

Tt is hereby enacted as follows :—

1. Short fife and commencement.-(1) This Act may be called the
Representation of the People (Seventh Amendment) Act, 1985.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of section 64, Act LXXXV of 1976.—In the Representation
of the People Aci, 1976 (LXXXV of 1976), in section 64, after the word
“sections *, the figure and comma “476,” shall be inserted.

3. Repeal.—The Representation of the People (Seventh Amendment) Ordi-
nance, 1985 (XXIV of 1985), is hereby repealed.



(391)

Price: Ps. 60.
(3064 Ex, Gaz.]



3/

Part 1] THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, BATRA, JULY a istas B93

3. Amendment of section $9, Acti LAAAY of iY76.—In the wi Act in
section 99, in sub-section (i), afier clause (c), the ivilowing uew clause shall be
inseried, namely :—

“(ee) he, being a person elected io ihe National Assembly or a Provincial
Assembly, is found by the Commission io uave subscribed, after ihe
commencement of the Represcntation of ibe People (bigath Amend-
ment) Ordinance, ivss, citer as proposer or seconder, m Cconttaven-
tion of the provisions of tis Act or ihc ruies made thereunder, to the
nomination of more than one candidate tor @ seat or seals ; or”,

4, Repeal.—The Representation of the People (Eighth Amendment) Ordinance,
1985 (XXVI of 1985), is hereby repealed,

ACT No. XH o¢ 1985 ~~
—
An Act further to amend ihe Members ay Parliament (Salaries and Allowances)
Act,

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Members of Parliament
(Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1974 (XXVII of 1974), for the purposes herein-
after appearing ;

It is hereby enacted as follows :—

1. Short title amd comimencemenii— (i) ims Ac. may be called the Mem-
bers of Parliament (Salaries aud Aliowaaces) (Amendment) Act, 1985.

(2) It shall come into force at once and shall be deemed (o have taken effect
on the first day of March, 1985.

2, Amendment of section 3, Act XXWil of 1974.—-In the Members of Par-
liament (Salaries and Allowanves) Aci, 1974 (KAVIi of 1974), hereinafter referred
to as the said Act, in section 3, for the words “one thousand and tive hundred ”
the words “ three thousand ” shali be substituted,

3. Amendment of section 4, Act KAVIL of 1974,—in the said Act, in section
4, in sub-section (1), for the words “iliiy rupees” luc words “one hundred and
fifty rupees ”, and for the wouds twenty-five rupees” the words “ one hundred
tupees ”, shall be substituted.

4. Amendment of section 5, Act YMVIL of 1974.—In ihe said Act, in section
5, in sub-section (1),—

(a) in clause (a), for the word “ third” the word “second” shall be
substituted ;

(b) in clause (b), for the words “ one and one-half of ihe first class air
fare” the words “the agg: “egate of one economy class air fare and
one second class railway fare” shail be substituted ; and



{c) in clause (c), for the words “one rupee per mile” the words “ two
rupees per kilometre” shall be substituted,



- At

>,
394 THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., JULY 27, 1985 [Parr I

5. Substitution of section 9, Act XXVII of 1974,—In the said Act, for
section 9 the following shall be substituted, namely :—

fm,

“9. Housing allowance—A member shall be paid a housing allowance
at the rate of three hundred rupees for each day during any period of
residence on duty. ”,

6, Amendment of section 16, Acf XXVIT of 1974.-—In the said Acl, in
section 10—

(a) in sub-section (1), for the words “six thousand and six hundred
rupees ”, twice occurring, the words “ fifteen thousand rupees” shall be
substituted ; and

(b) in sub-section (2), for the words “four thousand and two hundred
rupees bears to the sum of six thousand and six hundred rupees” the
words “ten thousand rupees bears to the sum of fifteen thousand
rupees ” shail be substituted.

7. Substitution of section 11, Act XXVIE of 1974-—In the said Act, for
section il the following shall be substituted, namely :—

“lL. Yelephone-—A member shall be entitled to have a telephone
installed at his residence at Government expenses where facilities for
installation are available and to a monthly allowance of five hundred
rupees on account of telephone charges, whether a telephone is so
installed or not. ”.

8. Insertion of new section ILA, Act XX VII of 1974,—In the said Act, after
section 11, amended as aforesaid, the following new section shall be inserted,
namely :—

“LILA. Office maintenance allowance—A member shall be entitled to

receive an office maintenance allowance at the rate of seven hundred
and fifty rupees per mensem, ”.

9. Additional of new section 144A, Act XXVIII of 1974.—In the said Act,
alier section 14, the following new section shall be added, namely :—

“4A. Act to have effect subject to instructions, ete—This Act — shall
have effect subject to such instructions, rules, exceptions, further con-
cessions or casemernts as the Federal Goyernment may from time to
time issue or grant.”.

ACT No. XIII oF 1985

An Act further to amend the Modaraba Companies and Modarabas (Floatation



and Control) Ordinance, 1980

Wuereas it is expedient further to amend the Modaraba Companies and
Modarabva (Floatation and Control) Ordinance, 1980 (XXXI of 1980), for the

purpose hereinafter appearing ;


