
} REGISTERED NO. M-302

q . Oo 127646

EXTRAORDINARY
PUBLISHED 8Y AUTHORITY

“ISLAMABAD, WEDNESDAY, MARCH 30, 1988

wien

PART I

Acts, Ordinances, President’s Orders and Regulations inclading Martial Law
Orders and Regulations

SENATE SECRETARIAT

Islamabad, the 30th March, 1988

The following Act of Majlis-e-Shoora (Parliament) received the assent of the
President on the 20th March, 1988 and is hereby published for General  infor-

mation :—
Act No. Ill oF 1988

An Act further to amend the Members of Parliament (Salaries and Aliowances)
Act, 1974

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Members of Parliament
(Salaries and Allowances) Act. 1974 (XXVII of 1974). for the purposes herein-
after appearing :

It is hereby enacted as follows :—

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) This Act may be called the Members
of Parliament (Salaries and Allowances) (Amendment) Act, 1988.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of section 3, Act XXVIT of 1974.—In the Members of
Parliament (Salaries anti Allowances) Act, 1974 (XXVIII of 1974), hereinafter
referred: ‘to as’ the said Act, ia section 3, in the proviso, for the words “ one
fhousand and five hondred” the words “three thousand ” shall ‘be substituted.

9)
Price: Ps. 30

(3278/Ex. Gaz]



v

10 THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., MARCH 30, 1988 (Part I

3. Amendment of section 4, Act XXVII of 1974.
4, for sub-section (2) the following shall be substituted, mele —

“(2) A member who arrives at iiie place of duty or departs from such
place shall be entitled to draw daily allowance and conveyance
allowance for the day of arrival or the day of departure, as the case
may be:

Provided that not more ihan one daily allowance and one con-
veyance allo wance may, in any case, be claimed in respect of any
one day. ”

4. Amendment of section 5, Act XXVII of 1974.—In the said Act, in
section 5, in sub-section (1), in clause (b), for the words “ one second class railway
fare” the words “one hundred and fifty rupees” shall be substituted.

5s. Amendment of section 6, Act XXVII of 1974.—In the said Act, in section

6,—
(a) in clause (bt). for the word “ first” the word “economy ” shall be
substituted :
(b) in clause (c), for the words “one rupee per mile” the words “two
‘ rupees per kilometre ~ shall be substituted ; and

(c) in ithe proviso, for the words “total amount of the daily allowance ”
the words, comma and figures “aggregate of the daily, conveyance and
housing allowances admissible under sections 4 and 9” shall be sub-
stituted.

6. Amendment of section 7. Act XNXVIL of 1974.—In the said Act, in
section 7,—-

(a) for the commas and words “.or one sitting of a committee, and
the commen-ement of another session or, as the case may be, another
sitting ” the words and commas “and the commencement of another
session, Or detween the termination of one sitting of a committee
and the corimencement of another sitting of the committee, ” shall
be substituted ; and

(b) in clause (a), for the words and figures “a daily allowance at the
rate specified in section 4” the words, comma and figures “daily,
conveyance and housing allowances at the rates specified in sections
4 and 9” shall be ‘substituted.

: 7. Amendment of section 8, Act XXVIII of 1974.—In the said Act, ia
Bection 8, for the words “or drawn by me from any other source” the words
from either House or from Government or a Government Organization ” shall
be substituted.

8. Amendment of section 10, Act XXVII of 1974.—In the said Act, in
fection 10,—



(a) in sub-section (1), for the words “ fifteen thousand ”, twice occurring,
the words “ thirty thousand ” shall be substituted ;



y

Z
c

Way I} THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., MARCH 30, 1988 1

=e ee = _ en

&) in sub-section (2),—

(i) for the words “ten thousand” the words “twenty thousand ”
shali be substituted ; and

Gi) for the words “ fifteen thousand ” the words “ thirty thousand ”
shall be substituted ; and

(©) in sub-section (3), in the explanation, for the word “servant” the
words “ other person ” shall be substitated.

9, Amendment of section 11, Act XXVII of 1974.—In the said Act, in
Section Py for the words “ five hundred ” the words “two thousand” shali be

10. Amendment of section 11A, Act XXVII of 1974.—In the said Act, in
section 11A, for the words “seven hundred and fifty” the words “three
thousand ” shall be substituted.

AZIZ AHMAD QURESHI,

—————_—_————— ee
QRERVER BY THE HANAGER, PRINTING CORPORATION OF PAKISTAN @RESS, ISLAMABAD
PUBLISHED BY THE MANAGER OF PUBLICATIONS, KARACH


