
aS:

M . 302
7646

Y
Che Gazette’ hot Pakistan
anes
EXTRAORDINARY
yeaa AUTHORITY

REGISTERED NO

ABAD, MONDAY, NOVEMBER 16, 1987

ISLAM.

PART I
Acts, Ordinances, President’s Orders and Regulations including Martisi Law
Orders and Regulations
SENATE SECRETARIAT
Islamabad, the 15th November, 1987

The following Acts of Majlis-e-Shoora (Parliament) received the assent of the
President on the 8th November, 1987, and are hereby published for general
information :—

Acr No, TX or 1987
An Act further to amend the Suppression of Terrorist Activities (Special Courts)
Act, 1975.

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Suppression of Terroris:
Activities (Special Courts) Act, 1975 (XV of 1975), for the purpose hercinafte
appearing ;

It is hereby enacted as follows :—

1. Shoxt title and commencement.—{1) This Act may be called the Suppres-
sion of Terrorist Activities (Special Courts) (Amendment) Act, 1987.

(2) ft shali come into force at once,

2, Amendment of Schedule, Act XV of 1975.--In the Suppression of
Terrorist Activities (Special Courts) Act, 1975 (XV of 1975), in the Schedule, in
paragraph (a), after sub-paragraph (ii), the following new sub-paragraph shali be
inserted, namely :-—

“ (iia) section 302 or section 307, if committed in the course of the same

transaction in which an offence specified in this paragraph or paragraphs
(b} and (©) is committed, or in addition to, or in combination with,
such offence ;*

(73)
[4447 /Ex. Gaz.]



Price :. Rs, 1.10



$3
78 THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA;. NOV. 16, 1987 (Par I

(2) It extends to the Islamabad Capital Territory.

(3) It shall come ‘nto force at once.

2. Omission of section 11, Act MNMWEHE of 1977.—In the Prevention of
Gambling Act, 1977 (XXVUi of 1977), section 11 shall be omitted.

Act No. XIV or 1987
eee
An Act further to amend ithe Small Business Finance Corporation. Act, 1972.

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Small Business Finance Cor-
poration Act, 1972 (XXIX of 1972), for the purposes hereinafier appearing ;

It is hereby enacted as follows :—-

1. Short title and conmencement—(i} This Act may be called the Small
Business Finance Corporation (Amendment) Act, 1987.

(2) It shail come into force at once.

2. Amendment of section 2, Act XXMEX of 1972.—In the Small Business
Finance Corporation Act, 1972 (XXIX of 1972), hereinafter referred to as the
said Act, in section 2, in clause (cc), for the words “ one miliion and five hundred
thousand rupees” the words “five million rupees” shall be substituted. :

seg

3. Amendment of section 18, Aci XXIM of 1972.—In the said Act, in
section 18,—

(a) in sub-section (1), in clause (a), for the words “ three hundred
thousand rupees” the words “six hundred thousand rupees” shall be
substituted ; and

(b) in sub-section (2),—

(i) for the words “ fifty thousand rupees ”, twice occurring, the words
“five hundred thousand rupees” shall be substituted ; and

(ii) for the provisos the following shall be substituted, namely :—

“Provided that, in the case of a cottage industry, this sub-
section shall have effect as if for the words “five huadred
- thousand rupees” the words “one million and five hundred

thousand rupees.” were substituted. ”.


