
REGISTERED No. ee

_ EXTRAORDINARY .*
PUBLISHED 6Y, AUTHORITY
LEO MNS SAN ame RET ——
ISLAMABAD, WEDNESDAY, BRUARY 7, 1973

PART I
Acts, Ordinances, President’s Orders and Regulations

NATIONAL ASSEMBLY OF PAKISTAN
fslamabad, the Tth February, 1973

The following Acts of the National Assembly received the assent of the
President on the 4th February, 1973, and are hereby published. for general
information :—

ACT No. XIV or 1973
An Act further to amend the Workmen's Compensation Act, 1923

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Workmen’s Compensation
Act. 1923 (ViI1 of 1923), for the purposes hereinafter appearing ;

It is hereby enacted as follows :—

1, Short title and commencement.—({i) This Act may be called the Work-
men’s Compensation (Amendment) Act. 1973.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of section 2, Act VIII of 1923.—In the Workmen’s Com-
pensation Act, 1923 (VII of 1923), hereinafter referred to as the said Act, in
section 2. in sub-section (1), in clause (nm), in sub-clause (ii), for the words “ five
hundred ” the words “one thousand” shall be substituted.

3. Amendment of section 4, Act VIIT of 1923.—In the said Act, in see-
tion 4, in sub-section (1),—
(a) in clause A, in sub-clause (ii), for the words “four hundred” the
words “four thousand” shall be substituted ;
(37)
Price : Ps. 37
(2918 Ex. Gaz.]



38 THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., FEB. 7, 1973 [PART 1
SUSE

(b) in clause B, in sub-clause (ii), for the words “two thousand” the
words “ten thousand” shall be substituted ;

(c) in clause D, in sub-clause (ii), for the word “thirty” the word :
“seventy-five ” shall be substituted ; and ;
: (d) in the proviso, in clause (a), after the word “ treatment”, at the end,
the words “and the half-monthly payments made. for the firse four
months of disablement” shall be added.

4. Amendment of section 16, Act VIII of 1923—In the said Act, in
section 10, in sub-section (1), for the words “one year", occurring twice, the
words * three years” shall be substituted.

5. Amendment of section 18A, Act VHI of 1923.—In the said Act,
in section 18A. sub-section (1A) shall be omitted.

6. Amendment of Schedule Hi, Act VIII of 1923.—In the said Act, in
Schedule IT,—

(a) in clause (i), the words “in a clerical capacity or” shall be omitted ;

(b) in clause (ii), the words “but not persons employed solely in a
clerical capacity in any room or place where no manufacturing
process is being carried on” shall be omitted ;

{c) in clause (v), the commas and words “,other than clerical work, ”
shall be omitted ; and -

(d) in clauses (x), (xiv), (xviii) and (xix), the commas and words “, other-
wise than in a clerical capacity.” wherever occurring shall be omitted.

7. Amendment of Schedule IV, Act VIEi of 1923.—In the said Act, in
Schedule TV, in column 1, for the figure “500” the figure “1,000” shall be
substituted.

8. Repeal—The Workmen’s Compensation (Amendment) Ordinance, 1972
(XL of 1972), is hereby repealed. .

ACT No, XV or 1973

“An Act further to amend the West Pakistan Employees’ Social Security
Ordinance, 1965

,_ WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the West Pakistan Employees’.
Social Security Ordinance, 1965 (West Pakistan Ordinance No. X of 1965), for.
the purposes hereinafter appearing ;

It is hereby enacted as follows :—

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) This Act may be called
Pakistan Employees’ Social Security (Amendment) Act, 1973. the West



(2) It extends to the whole of Pakistan.



PART THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA, FEB. is 1973 39.

. Amendment of section 35, W.P. Ordinance No. X ef 1965.—In the
West” Pakistan Employees’ Social Security Ordinance, 1965 (W. P. Ordinance
No. X of 1965), hereinafter referred to as the said Ordinance, in section 35, for
sub-section (2) the following shall be substituted, namely :—

(2) A secured person shall be entitled to receive sickness benefits through-
out the period of sickness :

Provided that during a continuous period of three hundred and
sixty-five days such benefit shall not be allowed for a period exceed-
ing—

(a) one hundred and eighty days, in case he has been suffering from
tuberculosis ; and

(b) one hundred and twenty-one days, in case he has been suffering
from any other disease :

Provided further that he shali not be entitled to receive such
benefit for the first two days of his sickness if such sickness does
Not, within fifteen days, follow the previous period of sickness
for which he received or was entitled to receive such benefit. ”.

3. Amendment of section 37, W. P. Ordinance No. X of 1965.—In the
said Ordinance, in section 37 for the word “fifty” the words “five hundred”

shall be substituted.

4. Amendment of section 67, W.P. Ordinance No. X of 1965.—In the
said Ordinance, in section 67, sub-section (4) shall be omitted.

5. Repeal of Ordinance No. XLI of 1972.—The West Pakistan Emp-
loyees’ Social Security (Amendment) Ordinance, 1972 (XLI of 1972), is hereby
tepealed.

ACT No, XVI or 1973
An Act further to amend the Factories Act, 1934

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Factories Act, 1934 (XXV of
1934), for the purposes hereinafter appearing ;

It is hereby enacted as follows :-—

1. Short title and commencement.—({1) This Act may be called the Factories
(Amendment) Act. 1973.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of section 2, Act XXV of 1934.—In the Factories Act, 1934
(XXV of 1934), hereinafter referred to as the said Act, in section 2,—

(a) in clause (h), after the word “ employ: ” occurring for the first time,
the words “ directly or through an agency” shall be inserted ; and




