SIND ACT NO. IV OF 1985
THE CO-OPERATIVE HOUSING AUTHORITY (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1985

[12!* DECEMBER, 1985]

AN Act to amend the Sind Co-operative Housing Authority
Ordinance, 1982.

WHEREAS it is expedient to amend the Co-operative Housing
Authority Ordinance, 1982, in the manner hereinafter appearing;
Itis hereby enacted as follows:-

() This Act may be called the Sind Co-operative Housing Authority

(Amendment) Act, 1985.

(2) Itshall come into force on at once and shall be deemed to have
taken effect on and from 24th September, 1985.

3)
In the Co-operative Housing Authority Ordinance, 1982,
hereinafter referred to as the said Ordinance, in section 14

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words "six months" the words "one
year" shall be substituted,;

(i) in sub-section (2), for the words "one year’, the words "two
years" shall be substituted.

In the said Ordinance, after section 14, the following section 14-A
shall be inserted:-

"14-4 Eligibility to election | Except with the permission of Government, no

person who was an office bearer in a society
immediately before its taking over under section

6 shall be eligible to contest election under sub-section (1) of
section 14.".

Preamble.

Short title
and
commence

ment.

Amendment
of section 14
of Sind

Ordinance V



of 1982.

Insertion
section 14-A
of Sind
Ordinance V
of 1982.



