
SINDH ACT NO.XI OF 2012

THE COLONIZATION OF GOVERNMENT LANDS
(SINDH AMENDMENT) ACT, 2011.

An Act to amend the Colonization of Government
Lands Act, 1912, in its application to the Province of Sindh.

WHEREAS it is expedient to amend the Colonization of
Government Lands Act, 1912, in its application to the
Province of Sindh, in the manner hereinafter appearing:

Itis hereby enacted as follows:-

1. (1) This Act may be called the Colonization of

Government Lands (Sindh Amendment) Act, 2011.
(2) — It shall come into force at once.
2. In the Colonization of Government Lands Act, 1912, in

its application to the Province of Sindh, in section 10, in sub-
section (5) -

(a) in clause (a), for the words “three months”, the
word “six months” shall be substituted;

(6) in clause (b), for the words “two years”, the
words “five years” shall be substituted.

[6h February, 2012]

Preamble.

Short title and
commencement.

Amendment of
section 10 of Act
V of 1912.


