SINDH ACT NO. XXXII OF 2013.

THE SINDH SPEAKER’S AND DEPUTY SPEAKER'S (SALARIES, ALLOWANCES AND
PRIVILEGES) (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2009.

[1s' April, 2013]

An Act to amend the Sind Speaker's and Deputy
Speaker’s (Salaries, Allowances and Privileges) Act, 1975.

WHEREAS it is expedient to amend the Sind Speaker's Preamble.
and Deputy Speaker’s (Salaries, Allowances and Privileges)
Act, 1975, in the manner hereinafter appearing;

It is hereby enacted as follows:-

(1) This Act may be called the Sindh Speaker’s and Deputy Short title and
Speaker's (Salaries, Allowances and Privileges) (Amendment) commencement.
Act, 2009.

(2) Itshall come into force at once and shall be deemed to
have taken effect on and from 15! July, 2011.

In the Sindh Speaker's and Deputy Speaker's (Salaries, Amendment of
Allowances and Privileges) Act, 1975, hereinafter referred as Section 3-A of
the said Act, in Section 3-A, for the words “five thousand”, the Vergy

words “seven thousand” shall be substituted. —

In the said Act, for section 5, the following shall be inserted:- Amendment of
Section 5 of the

Sind Act No. VII

of 1975.

"5 (1) The Salary of the Speaker and Deputy
Speaker, shall respectively be eighty thousand and
seventy thousand rupees per mensem.

(2) The Salary mentioned in sub-section (1), shall
automatically be increased by Government in
proportion increase in salary of civil servants.”



SINDH ACT NO. XXXII OF 2013.
PRIVILEGES) (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2009.

In the said Act, in section 6, in sub-section (2), for the
words “thirty nine thousand and five hundred”, and the
words “thirty five thousand” the words “fifty five thousand
three hundred” and words “forty nine thousand”, shall
respectively be substituted.

In the said Act, for section 7, the following shall be

“7. The Speaker or Deputy Speaker, as the case may be,
shall be entitled to use two official cars maintained at
Government expenses.”

In the said Act, in section 8, for the words “six
thousand”, — the words “eight thousand four hundred” shall
be substituted.

In the said Act, in section 8-A, for the word “both”,
the words “and a mobile phone on Government expenses”
shall be substituted.

In the said Act, in section 10, for the words “five
hundred fifty”, the words “seven hundred and seventy” shall
be substituted.

THE SINDH SPEAKER’S AND DEPUTY SPEAKER’S (SALARIES, ALLOWANCES AND

Amendment of
Section 6 of the
Sind Act No. VIl
of 1975.

Amendment of
Section 7 of the
Sind Act No. VII
of 1975.

Amendment of
Section 8 of the
Sind Act No. VI
of 1975.

Amendment of
Section 8-A of
the Sind Act No.
VIL of 1975.



